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“This unemployment returning again to plague us after so many repetitions during the century past is a 
sign of deep failure in our country. Unemployment is the great peacetime physical tragedy of the 
nineteenth and twentieth centuries, and both in its cause and in the imprint it leaves upon those who 
inflict it, those who permit it, and those who are its victims, it is one of the great moral tragedies of our 
time.”  
 
The Bishops of the United States, Unemployment, 1930.  
 
1. This was the judgment of our predecessors as they responded to the economic crisis of 1930. As 
pastors, teachers, and leaders, we recall and emphasize their words as our country faces important 
economic, social, and moral decisions in the midst of the highest unemployment since the 1930s.  
 
I. THE CHURCH’S CONCERN  
 
2. Despite recent hopeful signs, the economy is only slowly and painfully recovering from the recent 
recession, the worst since World War II. We are deeply concerned that this recovery may lack the 
strength or duration to alleviate the suffering of many of the victims of the recession, especially the 
unemployed. It is the moral, human, and social consequences of our troubled economy which concern 
us and their impact on families, the elderly, and children. We hope in these limited reflections to give 
voice to some of the concerns of the poor and working people of our land.  
 
3. We are keenly aware of the world-wide dimensions of the problem and the complexity of these issues 
of economic policy. Our concern, however, is not with technical fiscal matters, particular economic 
theories, or political programs, but rather the moral aspects of economic policy and the impact of these 
policies on people. Our economic life must reflect broad values of social justice and human rights. 
 
II. THE CHURCH’S TEACHING  
 
4. Our own rich heritage of Catholic teaching offers important direction and insight. Most importantly, 
we are guided by the concern for the poor and afflicted shown by Jesus, who came “to bring good news 
to the poor, to proclaim liberty to captives, new sight to the blind, and to set the downtrodden free” (Lk 
4:18). In addition, the social encyclicals of the popes and documents of the Second Vatican Council and 
the Synod of Bishops defend the basic human right to useful employment, just wages, and decent 
working conditions as well as the right of workers to organize and bargain collectively. They condemn 
unemployment, maldistribution of resources, and other forms of economic injustice and call for the 
creation of useful work experiences and new forms of industrial organization enabling workers to share 
in decision making, increased production, and even ownership. Again and again they point out the 
interrelation of economics and ethics, urging that economic activity be guided by social morality.  
 
5. Catholic teaching on economic issues flows from the Church’s commitment to human rights and 
human dignity. This living tradition articulates a number of principles which are useful in evaluating our 
current economic situation. Without attempting to set down an all-inclusive list, we draw the following 
principles from the social teachings of the Church and ask that policymakers and citizens ponder their 
implications. (a) Economic activity should be governed by justice and be carried out within the limits of 
morality. It must serve people’s needs. (b) The right to have a share of earthly goods sufficient for 



oneself and one’s family belongs to everyone. (c) Economic prosperity is to be assessed not so much 
from the sum total of goods and wealth possessed as from the distribution of goods according to norms 
of justice. (d) Opportunities to work must be provided for those who are able and willing to work. Every 
person has the right to useful employment, to just wages, and to adequate assistance in case of real 
need. (e) Economic development must not be left to the sole judgment of a few persons or groups 
possessing excessive economic power, or to the political community alone. On the contrary, at every 
level the largest possible number of people should have an active share in directing that development. 
(f) A just and equitable system of taxation requires assessment according to ability to pay. (g) 
Government must play a role in the economic activity of its citizens. Indeed, it should promote in a 
suitable manner the production of a sufficient supply of material goods. Moreover, it should safeguard 
the rights of all citizens, and help them find opportunities for employment.  
 
6. These are not new principles. They are drawn directly from the teachings of the Church, but they have 
critical relevance at this time of economic distress. Under current conditions, many of these principles 
are being consistently violated.  
 
III. DIMENSIONS OF THE ECONOMIC SITUATION  
 
7. In these reflections we wish to examine briefly the dimensions of our economic problems in three 
areas: unemployment, inflation, and distribution of wealth and income.  
 
A. Unemployment  
 
8. In October, government figures show eight million persons were unemployed, representing 8.6 
percent of the work force. Millions of other persons have given up seeking work out of discouragement 
or are in part-time jobs although they desire full-time work. Taking this into account, the actual level of 
unemployment in our country is over twelve percent. It is estimated that 20 million people will be 
jobless at some time this year, and that one-third of all Americans will suffer the traumatic experience of 
unemployment within their families.  
 
9. The official unemployment rate does more than underestimate the true extent of joblessness. It also 
masks the inequitable distribution of unemployment. The figures for October indicate that minorities, 
blue collar workers, young people, and women bear a disproportionate share of the burdens of 
joblessness.  
 
10. These realities clearly indicate that the nation’s commitment to genuine full employment has been 
seriously eroded, if not abandoned. Since World War II, unemployment has been substantial, persistent, 
and drifting upward. In fact, when joblessness rose dramatically during the latest recession, it took the 
form of an acute and visible crisis, superimposed on a long-term unemployment problem which has 
persisted for decades.  
 
11. The costs of this tragic under-utilization of our country’s human resources are enormous. In 
economic terms, these high levels of unemployment cost literally hundreds of billions of dollars in lost 
productivity and tens of billions of dollars in lost revenue and increased expenses for all levels of 
government.  
 
12. As lamentable as these financial costs are, the social and human impact is far more deplorable. In 
our society, persons without a job lose a key measure of their place in society and a source of individual 



fulfillment; they often feel that there is no productive role for them. Many minority youth may grow up 
without meaningful job experiences and come to accept a life of dependency. Unemployment 
frequently leads to higher rates of crime, drug addiction, and alcoholism. It is reflected in higher rates of 
mental illness as well as rising social tensions. The idleness, fear, and financial insecurity resulting from 
unemployment can undermine confidence, erode family relationships, dull the spirit, and destroy 
dreams and hopes. One can hardly bear to contemplate the disappointment of a family which has made 
the slow and painful climb up the economic ladder and has been pushed down once again into poverty 
and dependence by the loss of a job.  
 
13. The current levels of unemployment are unacceptable and their tremendous human costs are 
intolerable. Unemployment represents a vast and tragic waste of our human and material resources. We 
are disturbed not only by the present levels of joblessness, but also by official government projections of 
massive unemployment for the rest of this decade. We sincerely hope that these figures do not 
represent resignation to the human and economic waste implied in these rates of unemployment. As a 
society, we cannot accept the notion that some will have jobs and income while others will be told to 
wait a few years and to subsist on welfare in the interim. For work is more than a way to earn a living. It 
represents a deep human need, desired not only for income but also for the sense of worth which it 
provides the individual.  
 
B. Inflation  
 
14. There are those who insist that we must tolerate high levels of unemployment for some, in order to 
avoid ruinous inflation for all. Although we are deeply concerned about inflation, we reject such a policy 
as not grounded in justice. In recent 145 years, our country has experienced very high levels of inflation. 
During this past year, there has been some reduction in inflation, but there are already signs of its 
renewal, spurred by large increases in food and fuel prices.  
 
15. Inflation weakens the economic stability of our society and erodes the economic security of our 
citizens. Its impact is most severe on those who live on fixed incomes and the very poor. The double 
distress of inflation and recession has led to a painful decline in real income for large numbers of people 
in recent years. Clearly, steps must be taken to limit inflation and its impact.  
 
16. However, low unemployment and high inflation are not inevitable partners, as history and the 
experience of other industrialized countries bear out. Policymakers should seek and use measures to 
combat inflation which do not rely upon high rates of joblessness. For many of our fellow citizens, the 
major protection against inflation is a decent job at decent wages. C. Distribution of Income and Wealth  
 
17. Within our country, vast disparities of income and wealth remain. The richest twenty percent of our 
people receive more income than the bottom sixty percent combined. In the area of ownership, the 
disparities are even more apparent. The top one-fifth of all families own more than three-fourths of all 
the privately held wealth in the United States, while over one-half of our families control less than seven 
percent of the wealth.  
 
18. The distribution of income and wealth are important since they influence and even determine our 
society’s distribution of economic power. Catholic social teaching has condemned gross inequality in the 
distribution of material goods. Our country cannot continue to ignore this important measure of 
economic justice.  
 



IV. POLICY DIRECTIONS  
 
19. Fundamentally, our nation must provide jobs for those who can and should work and a decent 
income for those who cannot. An effective national commitment to full employment is needed to 
protect the basic human right to useful employment for all Americans. It ought to guarantee, through 
appropriate mechanisms, that no one seeking work would be denied an opportunity to earn a livelihood. 
Full employment is the foundation of a just economic policy; it should not be sacrificed for other political 
and economic goals. We would support sound and creative programs of public service employment to 
relieve joblessness and to meet the vital social needs of our people (housing, transportation, education, 
health care, recreation, etc.).  
 
20. The burden and hardship of these difficult times must not fall most heavily on the most vulnerable: 
the poor, the elderly, the unemployed, young people, and workers of modest income. We support 
efforts to improve our unemployment compensation system and to provide adequate assistance to the 
victims of the recession. Efforts to eliminate or curtail needed services and help must be strongly 
opposed.  
 
21. We continue to support a decent income policy for those who are unable to work because of 
sickness, age, disability, or other good reason. Our present welfare system should be reformed to serve 
our country and those in need more effectively.  
 
22. Renewed efforts are required to reform our economic life. We ask the private and public sectors to 
join together to plan and provide better for our future, to promote fairness in taxation, to halt the 
destructive impact of inflation, and to distribute more evenly the burdens and opportunities of our 
society. We also ask that consideration be given to a more efficacious use of the land, the nation’s 
primary resource, in order to provide gainful employment for more people. We should also explore the 
impact of technology and endeavor to preserve the small family farm and other approaches to economic 
life which provide substantial and productive employment for people. It is not enough to point up the 
issues in our economy and to propose solutions to our national problems while accepting uncritically the 
presupposition of an economic system based in large part upon unlimited and unrestrained profit.  
 
23. We pledge our best efforts in support of these goals. We call on local parishes, dioceses, Catholic 
institutions and organizations to undertake education and action programs on issues of economic 
justice. We renew our commitment to assist the needy and victims of economic turmoil through 
programs of financial assistance and active participation in the dialogue over the formulation and 
implementation of just economic policies. We call on our people to pray for our country in this time of 
need and to participate in the difficult decisions which can still fulfill the promise of our land.  
 
24. Working together with renewed vision and commitment, our country has the productive capacity 
and human and material resources to provide adequately for the needs of our people. We take this 
opportunity to renew the challenge of our fellow bishops of forty-five years ago: Our country needs, 
now and permanently, such a change of heart as will, intelligently and with determination, so organize 
and distribute our work and wealth that no one need lack for any long time the security of being able to 
earn an adequate living for himself and for those dependent upon him (The Bishops of the United 
States, Unemployment, 1930). APPENDIX  
 
25. In adopting this resolution, the bishops sought to link this effort to a major statement issued in 1919 
on similar matters. Entitled, “The Bishops’ Program for Social Reconstruction,” the statement called for: 



minimum wage legislation; unemployment insurance and protection against sickness and old age; 
minimum age limit for working children; legal enforcement of the right of labor to organize; a national 
employment service; public housing; and a long term program of increasing wages.  
 
26. It also urged: prevention of excessive profits and incomes through regulation of public utilities and 
progressive taxes on inheritance, income, and excess profits; participation of labor in management; a 
wider distribution of ownership through cooperative enterprises and worker ownership in the stock of 
corporations; and effective control of monopolies even by the method of government competition if 
that should prove necessary.  
 
27. Most of these proposals have been enacted. Partial progress has been made toward others. The 
1919 statement provides a historical framework for the current resolution and evidences a longstanding 
concern for economic justice on the part of the Catholic community in this country. 


